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I Nyoman Dita Pahang Putra <putra_indp.ts@upnjatim.ac.id> Tue, Nov 20, 2018 at 10:59 AM
To: editor@iaeme.com, iaemedu@gmail.com

Dear
Subscription Manager

I have submitted my article to http://www.iaeme.com/OnlinePaperSub.asp in form of adobe pdf, entitled "Land Value Estimation Model as Impact of Infrastructure Development in Kaliwates Jember
Indonesia" to International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology (IJCIET), through this email I attach my article file in the form of word and pdf.
I hope that my article can fulfill the requirements and can be published in the International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology (IJCIET).

If my article is acceptable, what is the cost of publishing my article in the International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology and how should I transfer the cost of publishing articles?

Thank You very much for all your attention

Best Regard,
DR. I Nyoman Dita Pahang Putra., ST, MT
Senior Lecturer in Civil Engineering at Universitas Pembangunan Nasional "Veteran" Jawa Timur, Surabaya - Indonesia.
Cellular Phone: +628123260260
Email: putra_indp.ts@upnjatim.ac.id ; ditaputra1@gmail.com
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IAEME Editing Department <editing@iaeme.com> Fri, Nov 23, 2018 at 9:26 PM
To: putra_indp.ts@upnjatim.ac.id

Dear Sir, 

Thanks for mail, Correction done..Kindly check the attached PDF 

Thanks 
IAEME

On Fri, Nov 23, 2018 at 7:34 PM Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> wrote: 
correct it
 
 
---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: I Nyoman Dita Pahang Putra <putra_indp.ts@upnjatim.ac.id> 
Date: Fri, Nov 23, 2018 at 2:24 PM
Subject: Table 2_page 1025 
To: IAEME Publication <editor@iaeme.com>, IAEME Publication Chief Editor <iaemedu@gmail.com> 
 
 
Dear Editor Team
 
In the presentation of Table 2 on page 1025, please allow me to revise it according to the table that I attached along with this email.
I try to put the table 2 by not changing the format of the revised template.
Hopefully this suggestion can be accepted, so that the templates and editing of the Journal of International Civil Engineering and Technology can be more neat and reliable.
My article title:
Land Value Estimation Model as Impact of Infrastructure Development in Kaliwates Jember Indonesia.
Thank you very much for all attention 
 
Best Regards,
DR. I Nyoman Dita Pahang Putra., ST, MT
Senior Lecturer in Civil Department
Universitas Pembangunan Nasional "Veteran" Jawa Timur
Surabaya - Indonesia     
 
 
 
 
 
--  
Dr .S. Balasubramanian
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication
www.iaeme.com
 

--  
Thanks & Regards 
IAEME Publication 
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I Nyoman Dita Pahang Putra <putra_indp.ts@upnjatim.ac.id> Sat, Nov 24, 2018 at 6:38 AM
To: IAEME Editing Department <editing@iaeme.com>

Dear Editor,

Thank you very much

Best Regards,
DR. I Nyoman Dita Pahang Putra., ST, MT
Senior Lecturer in Civil Department
Universitas Pembangunan Nasional "Veteran" Jawa Timur
Surabaya - Indonesia 
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I Nyoman Dita Pahang Putra <putra_indp.ts@upnjatim.ac.id>

scopus included 
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IAEME Editing Department <editing@iaeme.com> Mon, Feb 4, 2019 at 2:58 PM
To: putra_indp.ts@upnjatim.ac.id

dear sir
your article it has been indexed in the scopus database,i have attached the screenshot of your article in the database
kindly check it 

--  
Thanks & Regards 
IAEME Publication 

I Nyoman Dita Pahang Putra <putra_indp.ts@upnjatim.ac.id> Mon, Feb 4, 2019 at 5:03 PM
To: IAEME Editing Department <editing@iaeme.com>

Dear Editor,
Thank you very much

Thanks and Best Regards,
DR. I Nyoman D. Pahang Putra
[Quoted text hidden]
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